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Terms and Conditions of use: 

1. Introduction 

These terms and conditions ("Terms") govern the use of the recorded online courses 
("Course") provided by Radiation Safety Ireland. By accessing or using the Course, the 
("User") who has purchased a Course agrees to comply with and be bound by these 
Terms. 

2. Access and Licence 

2.1 Upon payment of the applicable fee, the User is granted a limited, non-exclusive, 
non-transferable licence to access and use the Course solely for personal, non-
commercial purposes for a specific time period. 

2.2 The User may either be a user acting in their own personal capacity (“Personal 
User”) or an employee of a company  (“Company User”) or other legal entity that has 
purchased the course on behalf of employees or contractors.  

3. Intellectual Property Rights 

3.1 All intellectual property rights in the Course, including but not limited to copyrights, 
trademarks, and trade secrets, are owned by Radiation Safety Ireland or its licensors. 

3.2 The User may not modify, adapt, translate, reverse engineer, decompile, or 
disassemble the Course or any part thereof. 

3.3 The Personal User may not share, distribute, video or digitally record, reproduce or 
use for commercial purposes training materials, PowerPoint presentations, course 
notes and recorded content produced by Radiation Safety Ireland without the prior 
formal agreement of Radiation Safety Ireland. 
 
3.4 The Company User may not share, distribute, record, reproduce or use for 
commercial purposes training materials, PowerPoint presentations, course notes and 
recorded content produced by Radiation Safety Ireland without the prior formal 
agreement of Radiation Safety Ireland. Course summary notes only may be distributed 
within the Company for the client’s employees or for the client’s essential contractors 



working on the client’s site. However in order to gain formal certification by Radiation 
Safety Ireland the Company User must register and complete the Course online. 
 
 

 

4. User Responsibilities 

4.1 The User is responsible for providing accurate and complete information during 
registration and for maintaining the confidentiality of login details. 

4.2 The User agrees not to use the Course for any unlawful or unauthorised purpose 
and to comply with all applicable laws and regulations. 

4.3 Formal certification is provided by Radiation Safety Ireland once a User 
successfully completes a training course. An individual may not claim to have 
completed a training course provided by Radiation Safety Ireland unless formal 
certification has been provided by Radiation Safety Ireland. 

4.4 Once the Course has been assigned to the user it must be completed within three 
months, after which the user will no longer have to access the course but will have 
access to download the certificate which was issued upon completion of the Course.  

5. Payment and Refunds 

5.1 Payment for the Course is due upon registration unless otherwise agreed in writing. 
All training courses must be paid for in advance either through the issuing of an official 
purchase order, payment on line by electronic banking, or payment through the online 
booking system on the website, www.radiationsafety.ie.  Radiation Safety Ireland may 
refuse to provide a training course or to issue certification following a training course if 
the course fee has not been paid in full. 

5.2 Costs for online training courses are per person and each individual wishing to 
undertake the online training must register for the online training course individually 
and pay the course fee online. 

5.3 Refunds will only be issued if requested within 28 days of purchase and if the 
Course has not been accessed or used 

 

6. Limitation of Liability 

6.1 To the fullest extent permitted by law, Radiation Safety Ireland shall not be liable for 
any indirect, incidental, special, or consequential damages arising out of or in 
connection with the use or inability to use the Course. 



6.2 Radiation Safety Ireland’s total liability under these Terms shall not exceed the 
amount paid by the User for the Course. 

7. Termination 

7.1 Radiation Safety Ireland reserves the right to terminate or suspend access to the 
Course at its sole discretion without prior notice for any reason, including but not 
limited to breach of these Terms by the User. 

8. Changes to Terms 

8.1 Radiation Safety Ireland reserves the right to modify or update these Terms at any 
time. Changes will be posted on the Radiation Safety Ireland’s website, and it is the 
User's responsibility to review these Terms periodically. 

9. Governing Law and Jurisdiction 

9.1 These Terms shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of 
Ireland. 

9.2 Any disputes arising out of or in connection with these Terms shall be subject to the 
exclusive jurisdiction of the courts of Ireland. 

10. Data protection 

10.1 We collect personal information from you, including information about your: 

• Name 
• Contact information 
• Billing or purchase information 

 

We keep your information safe by storing it securely and only allowing appropriately 
trained staff to access it. 

To learn more on how we protect your data, please visit 
www.radiationsafety.ie/dataprotection 

11. Contact 

If you have any questions or concerns regarding these Terms, please contact us at 
admin@radiationsafety.ie  

 


